
FINANCE COMMITTEE AGENDA 

Wednesday, September 9, 2015 

(Immediately Following Government Operations) 

1. Consent Agenda 

a. Ratifying execution of a modification to the Law Enforcement Officer 
(LEO) Reimbursement Agreement program, Other Transactional 
Agreement (OTA) between the Transportation Security Administration and 
the City of Bangor  

b. Ratifying execution of an application for the FY 2016-FY 2018 Law 
Enforcement Officer (LEO) Reimbursement Agreement program, Other 
Transactional Agreement (OTA) between the Transportation Security 
Administration and the City of Bangor 

c. Council Order, Authorizing Grant Application in the Amount of $150,000 
from MDEP for Capehart and Penjajawoc Phase II 

 
2. Bids/Purchasing 

a. Multiple Vehicles – Fleet Maintenance – Darlings Ford - $49,742, Quirk 
Ford - $30,468, Whited Ford - $34,526 

b. Catch Basins & Manhole Adjustments – Public Works – Federal Program 
Integrators - $65,914 

c. Metal Castings – WWTP/Public Works – Ti Sales - $62,794 (estimated) 
d. Request to Waive Bid Process – Public Works – Highway Tech - $33,480  
e. Request to Waive Bid Process – Airport Fuel Farm – Veriforce LLC - 

$40,000 
f. Request to Waive Bid Process – Airport – PNM Construction - $17,740 

3. Amendment to American Folk Festival Note 

4. Energy Efficiency Program Discussion 

5. Assessor’s Update  

6. Executive Session - 1 MRSA Section 405 (6) (c) Disposition of Real 
Estate  

7. Open Session – Executive Session – Disposition of Real Estate 
Recommendation(s) 

 



 
 
Interoffice Memorandum 
 
To: Finance Committee 
 
From: Tony Caruso, Airport Director 
 
CC: Cathy Conlow, City Manager 
      Debbie Cyr, City Finance Director 
      Tim Reynolds, Airport Accounting Manager 
       
Re: Ratifying execution of a modification to the Law Enforcement Officer (LEO) 
Reimbursement Agreement program, Other Transactional Agreement (OTA) between 
the Transportation Security Administration and the City of Bangor. 
 
Date: August 31, 2015 
 
The airport is requesting Finance Committee approval to ratify the actions of the City 
Manager in the execution of accepting the award of these funds. The Transportation 
Security Administration (TSA) has awarded funding to partially fund and extend the LEO 
project period from October 1, 2015 through January 31, 2016 to reimburse Bangor 
International Airport for using Bangor Law Enforcement personnel. The City of Bangor 
agrees to provide Law Enforcement Officer (LEO) support on site at the airport in 
accordance with current Security Directives as mandated by TSA. The award contract 
amount for the modification is $9,404.94 for the period of October 1, 2015 through 
January 31, 2016. Reimbursement is limited to actual costs not to exceed a rate of $20 
per hour and total FY 2016 reimbursement.   
 
The City was notified of this award on August 28, 2015 and advised that it needed to 
notify the TSA of its acceptance by September 4, 2015.  Therefore, the City Manager 
executed the necessary document to accept the award. 
 
If approved by the Finance Committee, a Resolve ratifying staff’s and accepting the 
funds will be on the next Council Agenda.   



 
 
Interoffice Memorandum 
 
To: Finance Committee 
 
From: Tony Caruso, Airport Director 
 
CC: Cathy Conlow, City Manager 
      Debbie Cyr, City Finance Director 
      Tim Reynolds, Airport Accounting Manager 
       
Re: Ratifying execution of an application for the FY 2016-FY 2018 Law Enforcement 
Officer (LEO) Reimbursement Agreement program, Other Transactional Agreement 
(OTA) between the Transportation Security Administration and the City of Bangor. 
 
Date: August 31, 2015 
 
The airport is requesting Finance Committee approval to ratify the actions of City Staff in 
the execution of the LEO reimbursement application for FY 2016 through FY 2018.  
The Transportation Security Administration (TSA) requires formal applications for the 
award of funding for the LEO project periods of FY 2016 through FY 2018, to reimburse 
Bangor International Airport for using Bangor Law Enforcement personnel. The City of 
Bangor agrees to provide Law Enforcement Officer (LEO) support on site at the airport 
in accordance with current Security Directives as mandated by TSA. The project costs 
estimate for the period of February 1, 2016 through December 31, 2018 is $339,733. 
Reimbursement is limited to actual costs not to exceed a rate of $20 per hour and total 
reimbursement for each defined fiscal year.   
 
If approved by the Committee, a Resolve will be placed on the next Council Agenda to 
ratify staff’s actions in submitting the application.   



 
 
______________________________COUNCIL ACTION_____________________________ 

 
     Item No.  15-XXX   

               
Date: September 14, 2015 

 
Item/Subject:  Order, Authorizing Application for a $150,000 Grant from the Maine 

Department of Environmental Protection as funded by the US EPA under 
Chapter 319 of the Clean Water Act   

 
Responsible Department:   Finance 
  
Commentary:  This order will authorize a $150,000 grant application from the Maine DEP (as funded 
by the US EPA [under chapter 319] of the Clean Water Act) for riparian restoration in Capehart Brook and 
planting large mature trees in the watershed. Willow wattles and dogwoods will also be planted along 
stream bank areas currently bare in an effort to provide shading thus lowering water temperature and 
hence improve water quality. The above described work is Capehart Phase III. A second project in the 
Penjajawoc watershed is also planned. This work, considered Penjajawoc Phase II, will consist of 
removing imperious coverage in the watershed. Two project areas are planned that will remove concrete 
separation islands located at the Bangor Mall and install rain gardens for stormwater treatment.  
Currently, two areas are planned. The Maine DEP administers US EPA 319 funding to improve water 
quality of urban impaired streams affected by non-point source (NPS) pollution.  The Maine DEP, a state 
environmental regulatory agency, is interested in seeing this Phase II restoration project for the Capehart 
watershed be funded as well as renewing its efforts with the with regard to water quality improvements 
in the Capehart Brook watershed and the Penjajawoc Stream watershed.  
 
This proposed phased project would provide structural best management practices (BMPS) in the 
Penjajawoc watershed and stabilize and provide riparian restoration as well as other stormwater 
treatment such as planting large, mature trees in the Capehart watershed. The tree planting project in 
Old Capehart will not only provide aesthetic beauty but provide a simple but proven stormwater 
treatment option. The total amount of funding being requested is $150,000 ($100,00.00 for Capehart and 
$50,000.00 for Penjajawoc) and requires a local match of 40% which the City will provide as “in-kind” 
offerings and cash provided by stormwater utility funds. 
 
 

 
  

        Department Head  
  
Manager's Comments:  

  
              City Manager 

  
Associated Information:     
  
Budget Approval: 

  
                     Finance Director 

  
Legal Approval: 

  
                          City Solicitor 
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AAssssiiggnneedd  ttoo  CCoouunncciilloorr    
  

CITY OF BANGOR 
  

  
  

(TITLE.)  Order, Authorizing Application for a $150,000 Grant from the Maine DEP and the US 
EPA as provided under Chapter 319 of the Clean Water Act.  
 
BByy  tthhee  CCiittyy  CCoouunncciill  ooff  tthhee  CCiittyy  ooff  BBaannggoorr::  
  
  OORRDDEERREEDD,,  TTHHAATT  tthhee  CCiittyy  iiss  hheerreebbyy  aauutthhoorriizzeedd  ttoo  aappppllyy  ffoorr  aa  $$115500,,000000  GGrraanntt  ffrroomm  MMaaiinnee  
DEP and the US EPA as provided under Chapter 319 of the Clean Water Act.  
    
  



CITY OF BANGOR 
AWARD RECOMMENDATION

BID ITEMS: Multiple Vehicles

DEPARTMENT: Public Works

BUDGET AMOUNT: 80,000 AMOUNT OF AWARD: 30,468
34,526

ACCOUNT NUMBER: 7718-91001150

VENDOR(S) RECOMMENDED: Quirk Ford and Whited Ford

Past Experience with Vendor : x Excellent Good Fair

Poor None

OTHER COMMENTS:

The first vehicle listed on the bid tabulation was incorrect, therefore this opportunity will not be 
awarded at this time, but will be rebid.  Staff recommendation is to award the remaining vehicles to 
the low bidders as follows:  vehicle #2 (Public Works) Quirk Ford in the amount of $30,468, and 
vehicle #3 (Public Works) Whited Ford in the amount of $34,526.  



Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total 
Item Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 Vehicle No. 1 1 No Bid $50,843.00 $50,843.00 $49,742.00 $49,742.00
Year/Make/Model

2 Vehicle No. 2 1 $33,625.90 $33,625.90 $31,260.00 $31,260.00 $30,844.00 $30,844.00
Year/Make/Model

3 Vehicle No. 3 1 No Bid $34,526.00 $34,526.00 $34,602.00 $34,602.00
Year/Make/Model
Delivery time after receipt of order Not Provided 8-10 weeks
Discount if all vehicles are purchased by your company? N/A No $25/unit

Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total 
Item Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 Vehicle No. 1 1 $50,045.84 $50,045.84 $66,713.00 $66,713.00 $59,656.00 $59,656.00
Year/Make/Model

2 Vehicle No. 2 1 $30,468.38 $30,468.38 No Bid No Bid
Year/Make/Model

3 Vehicle No. 3 1 $34,718.70 $34,718.70
Year/Make/Model
Delivery time after receipt of order 10-14 days 16-20 weeks
Discount if all vehicles are purchased by your company? Net N/A N/A

2016 Ford F-450 4x2 Crew Cab 2016 Isuzu NPR-XD 2016 Isuzu NPR- HD Gas

2016 Ford F2B F-250 R/C

2016 Ford W3F F-350 C/C 4x4

City of Bangor Bid Tabulation
Bid No.: B16-009 Multiple Truck Bid
Bid Opening : August 26, 2015

2016 Ford F-350 Crew Cab 2016 Ford F-350 SRW Chassis
18-20wks (#1), 12-14 wks

Quirk Ford Daigle Houghton Option 1 Daigle Houghton Option 2

O' Connor's
Augusta, ME

Whited Ford
Bangor, ME

Darlings Ford
Bangor, ME

Augusta, ME Bangor, ME Bangor, ME

 2016 GMC 2500 HD Reg Cab 4x4

2016 Ford F-450 Crew Cab 2016 Ford F-450 Chassis Cab

2016 Ford F-250 XL  2016 Ford F-250



CITY OF BANGOR 
AWARD RECOMMENDATION

BID ITEMS: Catchbasins and Manhole Adjustments

DEPARTMENT: Public Works

BUDGET AMOUNT: Part of Paving AMOUNT OF AWARD: 65,914
Estimated value of paving
prep work

ACCOUNT NUMBER: 7601-91008712

VENDOR(S) RECOMMENDED: Federal Program Integrators

Past Experience with Vendor : Excellent x Good Fair

Poor None

OTHER COMMENTS:

Staff recommendation is to award the catchbasin and manhole adjustment work required as part of 
the annual paving program to the low bidder, Federal Program Integrators.  The award amount above 
is only an estimate of the amount of work that will be required. 



City of Bangor Bid Tabulation

RFB No. B16-008: CB & Manhole Adjustments

Bid Opening: 8/19/15

Lou Silver, Inc
Orono, ME

Item Description Est. Ann. 
Qty.

Unit Unit Price Total Price

1 Catch Basin/ Manhole Structures Installed 50 Each $1,250.00 62,500.00                                       
2 Additional Rounds of Bricks 20 Each $250.00 5,000.00                                        
3 Backfilling and Paving 50 Each $750.00 37,500.00                                       

Total Bid Price: 105,000.00                                     

Eastwood Contractors, Inc*
Brewer, ME

Item Description Est. Ann. 
Qty.

Unit Unit Price Total Price

1 Catch Basin/ Manhole Structures Installed 50 Each $925.00 $46,250.00
2 Additional Rounds of Bricks 20 Each $110.00 $2,200.00
3 Backfilling and Paving 50 Each $725.00 $36,250.00

Total Bid Price: $84,700.00

Federal Program Integrators*
Indian Island, ME

Item Description Est. Ann. 
Qty.

Unit Unit Price Total Price

1 Catch Basin/ Manhole Structures Installed 50 Each $1,151.00 $57,550.00
2 Additional Rounds of Bricks 20 Each $23.75 $475.00
3 Backfilling and Paving 50 Each $157.78 $7,889.00

Total Bid Price: $65,914.00

* Math Error Corrected. Total Bid Price based on Unit Price.



CITY OF BANGOR 
AWARD RECOMMENDATION

BID ITEMS: Metal Castings

DEPARTMENT: Public Works/Sewer

BUDGET AMOUNT: Supplies AMOUNT OF AWARD: 62,794
Estimated value of supplies
actual will vary based on need

ACCOUNT NUMBER: Various

VENDOR(S) RECOMMENDED: Ti-Sales Inc

Past Experience with Vendor : Excellent Good Fair

Poor x None References checked
Bangor Water 

OTHER COMMENTS:

Staff recommendation is to award the supply contract for metal castings to Ti Sales, the low bidder.  
Metal castings are purchased on an as needed basis by both Public Works and Sewer Maintenance 
operations.  The award amount above is only an estimate of annual costs. 



E. J. Prescott Ferguson Waterworks
Gardiner, ME South Portland, ME

Item Description Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 6" x 1 1/8" 120 ea $150.78 $18,093.60 $142.34 $17,080.80 $149.15 $17,898.00
2 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 8" x 1 1/8" 5 ea $167.64 $838.20 $178.25 $891.25 $173.06 $865.30
3 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 4" x 1 1/8" 25 ea $139.35 $3,483.75 $124.00 $3,100.00 $138.22 $3,455.50
4 Catchbasin Frames (square) 24" x 6" x 2" 50 ea $144.24 $7,212.00 $166.63 $8,331.50 $143.20 $7,160.00
5 Manhole Cover (round) 26" x 1 1/8" 50 ea $149.40 $7,470.00 $148.69 $7,434.50 $147.96 $7,398.00
6 Catchbasin Grates (round) 26" x 1 1/8" 50 ea $149.40 $7,470.00 $124.00 $6,200.00 $147.96 $7,398.00
7 Catchbasin Grates (square) 24" x 2" 5 ea $162.52 $812.60 $151.13 $755.65 $161.29 $806.45
8 Catchbasin Grate (cascade)(square) 24" x 2" 50 ea $189.53 $9,476.50 $135.63 $6,781.50 $187.90 $9,395.00
9 Catchbasin Riser (square) 24" x 1 1/2" 50 ea $138.61 $6,930.50 $87.50 $4,375.00 $137.59 $6,879.50
10 Manhole Risers (round) 26" x 1 1/2" 50 ea $138.55 $6,927.50 $87.50 $4,375.00 $141.50 $7,075.00
11 Manhole Risers (round) 26" x 2" 25 ea $151.81 $3,795.25 $93.75 $2,343.75 $157.25 $3,931.25
12 Manhole Risers (round) 24" x 1 1/2" 15 ea $138.61 $2,079.15 $75.00 $1,125.00 $137.59 $2,063.85
13 Ductile Iron Manhole Frames & Covers (round) 24" x 4" 16 ea $417.02 $6,672.32 no bid $419.80 $6,716.80

Discount for Pickup at Plant 0% 0%
Minimum Order None $1,000 25%

81,261.37$      62,793.95$   81,042.65$ 

Ti-Sales, Inc.

Total Bid Amount:

Sudbury, MA

City of Bangor
Bid Tabulation - Bid No. B16-005 - Metal Castings- Revised
Bid Opening: 08/12/15









 
 
Interoffice Memorandum 
 
To: Finance Committee 
 
From: Robbie Beaton, Superintendent of Operations 
 
CC: Cathy Conlow, City Manager 
      Debbie Cyr, City Finance Director 
      Tony Caruso, Airport Director 
      John Theriault, City Engineer 
      Wynne Guglielmo, Environmental Compliance 
       
Re: Request to Waive Bid Process -  Airport – Fuel Farm: Operations & Maintenance Procedures 
& Integrity Management Plan development proposal  
 
Date: August 31, 2015 
 
The airport is requesting Finance Committee approval to hire Veriforce, LLC. to develop an 
operations and maintenance procedures manual, and an integrity management plan for the fuel 
farm system at Bangor International Airport (BGR). The airport’s fuel farm is now regulated 
under the Department of Transportation (DOT), and there are extensive regulations and 
requirements that the airport must comply with. Airport staff has been working diligently to get 
the airport in full compliance. These manuals, as well as an emergency/contingency plan, are 
required integral parts for full DOT compliance. 
 
The airport recently hired Veriforce to review and research our fuel farm’s current operations, 
equipment, facility, damage prevention measures, records and documentation management, and 
training. From this research and review, Veriforce provided a plan, and cost estimate, to develop 
an operations and maintenance procedures manual, and an integrity management plan that will 
be in compliance with DOT regulations. Also included is training of personnel. 
 
The airport is respectfully requesting to hire Veriforce, LLC for an amount not to exceed $40,000. 
We contacted several reference checks with other fuel farms and pipeline facilities that have used 
Veriforce and have heard very positive comments with their service and final products. The 
airport also currently uses Veriforce for Operator qualification training. 
 



 

To: Finance Committee 

From: Robbie Beaton, Superintendent of Operations 

CC: Deb Cyr, Finance Manager 

      Catherine Conlow, City Manager 

      Tony Caruso, Airport Director 

Re: Request to Waive Bid Process – PNM Construction Roof Membrane 

Date: 9/1/2015 

In 2011, the Airport awarded a contract to PNM Construction to install a waterproofing roof 
membrane on Docks 10, 12, 13 and the older section of Dock 11.  The newer section of Dock 
11 was not completed because roof leaks were minimal and more work was required on the 
other docks.  The airport decided to take care of the worst sections of all the hangers first and 
review doing this section of dock 11 at a later date.  During the initial contract, PNM did some 
preliminary patching and minor waterproofing on Dock 11, but did not spray on the waterproof 
membrane. This past year we have started to experience more and more leaks in the section 
that was not completed.  Since PNM Construction held the contract and has started the work for 
Dock 11, the Airport is requesting the Finance Committee to waive the bid process and allow 
PNM to return and complete the two coats of the waterproof membrane on Dock 11 for the 
amount of $17,740.  PNM will honor their original price per square foot and warranty with the 
product.   

If you have any questions or concerns please feel free to contact me. 

 

 



MEMORANDUM 
 

 
To: Bangor City Council Finance Committee 
From: Norman S. Heitmann, III, City Solicitor 
Re: American Folk Festival Promissory Note 
Date: August 19, 2015 
 
 
 In 2102 the City and the American Folk Festival entered into a five year agreement for 
the operation of the American Folk Festival on the Bangor Waterfront.  At the same time the 
Folk Festival signed a promissory note to repay the City $239,933.56 due the City.  The note was 
for a period of five years with a ten year amortization with annual payments of $29,991.70 and a 
final payment of the outstanding balance on November 1, 2016.  The current balance due is 
$149,993.56.  The interest rate on the note is 0.0%. 
 

The Folk festival has requested that the City refinance the remaining balance of the note 
with a ten year amortization, with the other terms and conditions of the note to remain the same.  
If the City agrees the payment due on November 1, 2015 would be $14,999.39 and the final 
payment of the outstanding balance would be due on November 1, 2016.  It is anticipated that the 
American Folk Festival will be requesting a new agreement for the operation of the American 
Folks Festival on the Bangor Waterfront next year beyond 2016.  At that time, the promissory 
note would be revised to mirror the term of the operation agreement. 
 
 



 

ENERGY EFFICIENCY AS A POLICY PRIORIT Y 

TO: FINANCE COMMITTEE 

FROM: JOSHUA PLOURDE 

DATE: SEPTEMBER 3, 2015 

CC: CATHERINE CONLOW 

Background 

Several councilors have expressed continued interest in the Bangor City Council offering leadership in the realm of 
community-wide energy efficiency.  

Energy costs represent likely the most volatile expenses seen by families throughout Bangor given Maine’s harsh 
winters, cost of energy, and aged housing stock. The best way for families to cut down their energy bills is to, simply, 
use less fuel. In order to accomplish this, efficiency upgrades can be made ranging from replacing insulation or 
windows to installing heat pumps and other high efficiency appliances. For some households, on-site energy 
production may also make sense: these solutions could include solar panels (hot water or photovoltaic), small-scale 
wind turbines, or biomass furnaces. The best method of determining which upgrades represent the strongest 
investment is through an energy audit performed by a certified professional. In summary, using less energy keeps 
more money in the pockets of homeowners. 

There are several programs that the city can investigate to offer homeowner assistance, financial or otherwise, to 
reduce energy consumption city-wide and ultimately save homeowners money. 

Proposed Action Plan – Create an Energy Efficiency Program 

At this point, approval is sought for city staff to work with the council to develop a compressive energy efficiency 
program for the City of Bangor. This will include investigation into financing mechanisms (CDBG for LMNI families, 
bonding, group-purchasing facilitated by the city, regional partnership with lending institutions, etc.) that the city and 
homeowners can take advantage of. This effort will also include outreach to Efficiency Maine to determine how the 
city could leverage available rebate and financing options. The overall goal of the program would be to rely on existing 
resources wherever possible.  

In addition to investigating how the city can assist homeowners, the plan will address initial steps the city can take to 
reduce its own energy consumption.  

If approved, the group will return in October with more program specifics and a development timeline.  

 



Memo to City Council Finance Committee 
 
From: Councilor Faircloth  
 
Interest Free Loan for Bangor Residents to Lower Their Energy Bill 
 
There are approximately 5150 owner-occupied residences in Bangor.  Approximately 
15% of these homes would be 772.5 homes, 20% is 1,010 homes.  It is difficult to find 
proposals that will lower energy costs for a significant portion of Bangor residents. I 
believe this proposal meets that test.   
 
The goal is to: 

1) decrease the winter heating bill for a substantial portion of Bangor’s 
approximately 5150 owner-occupied residents; 

2) improve the housing stock in Bangor overall, given that Maine has America’s 
oldest housing stock and is most reliant on oil burners;  

3) increase the attractiveness of Bangor to potential homebuyers; and 
4) decrease Bangor’s carbon footprint.  

 
The proposal is that the City of Bangor institute an interest-free loan to all Bangor-
residents who take important steps to lower their home heating bill. I thank city staff very 
much for checking with bond council about this matter and confirming that the proposal 
meets requirements for tax-exempt status on for a potential bond.  
 
I’ve met with, and provided information to, one banking institution that is very 
enthusiastic about participating in this partnership. I’ve spoken with another institution 
that likes the idea in preliminary discussions and wants to discuss it more.  Participating 
lenders would fund loans for the following purposes: an energy audit, weatherization, 
conversion to a cleaner energy-saving boiler, and for solar panel installation.  
 
For this discussion consider the following loan levels:  
 
1) Weatherization Loan:  a maximum loan of $3500 interest free loan with preceding 
energy audit included. 
 
2) Solar Panel or Boiler Conversion Loan: a maximum loan of $10,000.  
 
A municipal bond of 1.2 million would absorb all interest payments with qualified lenders 
on behalf of city residents on an energy efficiency loan, thus offering city residents 
interest free loans.   
 
This measure I’d suggest could meet a goal of modernizing Bangor’s housing stock to 
the tune of 15% of Bangor residents and perhaps more.  This percentage would be 
significantly more than most other methodologies have been able to achieve.  
 
City staff, working with private lending institutions and other community players could, I 
am very hopeful, utilize this innovative opportunity to help us achieve the following 
important goal: decrease the heating costs of a significant portion Bangor residents.  
 
 
 
















































	FINANCE COMMITTEE AGENDA
	1Finance - TSA LEO extension SEP 2015
	2Finance - TSA LEO FY16 thru FY18 application
	3CA - MDEP Sec 319 Grant - Capehart, Penjajawoc Phase II
	4CO - MDEP Sec 319 Grant - Capehart, Penjajawoc Phase II
	CITY OF BANGOR

	5-8 9-9-15
	Sheet1

	5-8B16-005 Metal Castings
	Sheet1

	5-8B16-008 CB & Manhole Adjustment
	Sheet1

	5-8B16-009 Multiple Truck Bids
	Sheet1

	9Penobscotcorridortrafficequip9 7 15
	10Finance - Veriforce O  M request SEP 2015
	11Finance - PNM Construction sole source
	12Folk Festival Note 8-19-15
	13Energy Efficient Program Memo 1
	TO:
	FINANCE COMMITTEE

	FROM:
	JOSHUA PLOURDE

	DATE:
	SEPTEMBER 3, 2015

	CC:
	CATHERINE CONLOW


	14Energy Efficient - Faircloth 2
	15Assessor's Update

