CITY OF BANGOR

AWARD RECOMMENDATION
BID ITEM(S): Multiple Vehicles
DEPARTMENT: Fleet Maintenance
BUDGET REFERENCE: 8003-91001150 (Item 1, WWTP)

7705-91001150 (Item 2, Parks)
7709-91001150 (Item 3, Pub Works)
Requisition No.: Account Number:_7706-91001150 (Item 4, Pub Works)

Item 1 - $50,000
Item 2 - $40,000
Item 3 - $35,000
Budgeted Amount and Available Balance: $__Item 4 - $17,500

$ 112,054
Total Amount of Award Recommended: $ 18,055

Whited Ford
Vendors Recommended: Quirk Ford

Bid Opening Date: 08/29/2014

Past Experience with Vendor: _X_ Excellent ___Good __ Fair Poor No Prior Experience
If no experience, references checked or other method of vendor reliability established .

OTHER COMMENTS: Staff recommendation is to award the contracts to the low bidder
for each vehicle, Whited Ford - $50,251 (Item 1), $29,816 (Item 2), $31,987 (Iltem 3)
and Quirk Ford - $18,055 (Item 4).

Finance Director
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CITY COUNCIL FINANCE COMMITTEE:
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City of Bangor Bid Tabulation
RFP No. B15-008: Multiple Truck Bid
RFP Opening: 8/29/14

O'Connor's Darlings Ford
Augusta, ME Bangor, ME
Item Description Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 Full Size; 1 ton; 4WD, Duel Rear
1 Wheel ; Crew Cab; L pack, Dump Body 1 no bid no bid $51,170.00 $51,170.00
w/ Crane
1 Full Size; %2 Ton; 4WD; Crew Cab p/u
2 with liftgate 1 $31,524.55 $31,524.55 $30,905.00 $30,905.00
1 Full Size; 1 Ton; 2WD, Duel Rear
3 Wheel ; Regular Cab w/ Dumping Flat 1 $33,710.10 $33,710.10 $33,349.00 $33,349.00
Bodv
4 i /Fu“” Size; %2 Ton; 2WD; Regular Cab 1 $20,920.00 $20,920.00 $18,699.00 |  $18,699.00
Total Bid Price: $86,154.65 $134,123.00
Quirk Ford of Augusta Whited Ford
Hallowell, ME Bangor, ME
Item Description Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 Full Size; 1 ton; 4WD, Duel Rear
1 Wheel ; Crew Cab; L pack, Dump Body 1 $51,409.00 $51,409.00 $50,251.00 $50,251.00
w/ Crane
H - 3 - -
, | Lrull Size: ¥ Ton; 4WD; Crew Cabp/u) 4 $31,606.00 $31,606.00 $29,816.00 $29,816.00
with liftgate
1 Full Size; 1 Ton; 2WD, Duel Rear
3 Wheel ; Regular Cab w/ Dumping Flat 1 $33,747.00 $33,747.00 $31,987.00 $31,987.00
Bodv
4 é /Fu“” Size; %2 Ton; 2WD; Regular Cab 1 $18,055.00 $18,055.00 no bid no bid
Total Bid Price: $134,817.00 $112,054.00
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