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Request for Bids  Purchasing Department 
Metal Castings   73 Harlow Street 
Bid No.: B16-005          Bangor, Maine 04401  
Issue Date: August 7, 2015 207-992-4282

Addendum No. 1 

The following correction has been made to the City’s RFB: Metal Castings under Section XII: 
General Requirements.  

 All items shall conform to the requirements of AASHO M 306 and ASTM
Class 30 Gray Iron and be of Bibby or equivalent.

Additional Requested Information: The previous contract was renewed/  extended 
in 2012. Therefore, the latest bid tab for Metal Castings is from 2008. I t is 
attached along w ith updated pricing.  

All other terms, conditions and specifications remain the same. 

Please acknowledge this addendum by signing the acknowledgement below and 
returning this form with you bid.  

If you have already submitted a bid and would like to make a change reflecting this 
addendum, you may request in writing your bid be returned to you.  

The following Addendum(s) is/are hereby acknowledged: 

Addendum No. 1 – Issued August 7, 2015 

____________________________________ 
Business Name 

____________________________________ 
Name (print or type)  

_______________________________ 
Signature 



City of Bangor
Bid Tabulation - Bid No. B08-018 - Castings/Revised Maine Water Works Supply EJ Prescott, Inc.
Bid Opening: 04/02/08 Oakland, ME Bangor, ME

Item Description Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 6" x 1 1/8" 92 ea 130.00$     11,960.00$                 113.00$     10,396.00$             119.38$       10,982.96$                      
2 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 8" x 1 1/8" 5 ea 130.00$     650.00$                      152.00$     760.00$                  212.86$       1,064.30$                        
3 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 4" x 1 1/8" 20 ea No Bid No Bid 133.00$     2,660.00$               147.34$       2,946.80$                        
4 Catchbasin Frames (square) 24" x 6" x 2" 20 ea 115.50$     2,310.00$                   124.30$     2,486.00$               131.61$       2,632.20$                        
5 Manhole Cover (round) 26" x 1 1/8" 30 ea 85.00$       2,550.00$                   115.80$     3,474.00$               122.42$       3,672.60$                        
6 Catchbasin Grates (round) 26" x 1 1/8" 50 ea 93.00$       4,650.00$                   69.90$       3,495.00$               73.50$         3,675.00$                        
7 Catchbasin Grates (square) 24" x 2" 5 ea 84.00$       420.00$                      106.50$     532.50$                  112.07$       560.35$                           
8 Catchbasin Grate (cascade)(square) 24" x 2" 5 ea 119.00$     595.00$                      105.50$     527.50$                  111.42$       557.10$                           
9 Catchbasin Riser (square) 24" x 1 1/2" 50 ea No Bid No Bid 110.00$     5,500.00$               107.10$       5,355.00$                        
10 Manhole Risers (round) 26" x 1 1/2" 100 ea No Bid No Bid 68.92$       6,892.00$               72.97$         7,297.00$                        
11 Manhole Risers (round) 26" x 2" 25 ea No Bid No Bid 83.68$       2,092.00$               88.61$         2,215.25$                        
12 Manhole Risers (round) 24" x 1 1/2" 15 ea No Bid No Bid 77.16$       1,157.40$               107.10$       1,606.50$                        
13 Ductile Iron Manhole Frames & Covers (round) 24" x 4" 16 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 266.70$       4,267.20$                        

Discount for Pickup at Plant 0% 0% 0%
Minimum Order None None None

23,135.00$                 39,972.40$             46,832.26$                      

Item Description Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 6" x 1 1/8" 92 ea 153.86$     14,155.12$                 220.00$     20,240.00$             
2 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 8" x 1 1/8" 5 ea 214.57$     1,072.85$                   230.00$     1,150.00$               
3 Catchbasin/Manhole Frames (round) 26" x 4" x 1 1/8" 20 ea 148.53$     2,970.60$                   210.00$     4,200.00$               
4 Catchbasin Frames (square) 24" x 6" x 2" 20 ea 133.62$     2,672.40$                   240.00$     4,800.00$               
5 Manhole Cover (round) 26" x 1 1/8" 30 ea 149.81$     4,494.30$                   196.00$     5,880.00$               
6 Catchbasin Grates (round) 26" x 1 1/8" 50 ea 125.52$     6,276.00$                   196.00$     9,800.00$               
7 Catchbasin Grates (square) 24" x 2" 5 ea 136.90$     684.50$                      200.00$     1,000.00$               
8 Catchbasin Grate (cascade)(square) 24" x 2" 5 ea 175.60$     878.00$                      230.00$     1,150.00$               
9 Catchbasin Riser (square) 24" x 1 1/2" 50 ea 104.72$     5,236.00$                   125.00$     6,250.00$               
10 Manhole Risers (round) 26" x 1 1/2" 100 ea 142.22$     14,222.00$                 130.00$     13,000.00$             
11 Manhole Risers (round) 26" x 2" 25 ea 151.11$     3,777.75$                   135.00$     3,375.00$               
12 Manhole Risers (round) 24" x 1 1/2" 15 ea 104.72$     1,570.80$                   125.00$     1,875.00$               
13 Ductile Iron Manhole Frames & Covers (round) 24" x 4" 16 ea 379.62$     6,073.92$                   -$           -$                        

Discount for Pickup at Plant None 1.00%
Minimum Order Delivery in Truck load $3,500
Total Bid Amount: 64,084.24$                 72,720.00$             

United States Foundries, Inc.
Bangor, ME Manchester, NH

Neenah Foundry Co.
Neenah, WI

Total Bid Amount:

Ferguson Waterworks
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